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Coupa

Sourcing Events for Vendors
Introduction

Deloitte Government & Public Services Procurement leverages Coupa to support the procure-to-pay process.
This document is designed to assist you, the vendor, with responding to Sourcing Events received from Deloitte
GPS via the Coupa. Deloitte GPS uses Coupa in combination with other systems to procure goods and services

in support of government and higher education contracts.

Deloitte continues to leverage our GPS Vendor Portal for compliance documentation required for Federal
Government bids. Compliance documentation includes Representations and Certifications, Adequacy of
Accounting Survey and Certificates of Insurance. If you receive a request to register in the GPS Vendor Portal,

access https://vendorportal.gps.deloitte.com, click and review the content under New to

the GPS Vendor Portal.


https://vendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/

GPS Coupa

Sourcing Events for Vendors
Instructions

Quick Reference Guide

Accessing the Sourcing Event

Open the email. There will be a message from the Deloitte GPS Procurement Professional

inviting you to respond to the event. See example below.

Click View Event. Selecting View Event is recommended to ensure you are aware of event

details before deciding whether to participate.

RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice invitation - Sourcing Event #272 Inbox x

Deloitte GPS Coupa - S (test) <do_not_re

tome ~

Deloitte. RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice invitation - Sourcing Event #272

Deloitte GPS Coupa has invited you to the sourcing event RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice.

If you intend to participate, review the event timeline and accept the terms and conditions of the event, if applicable

Deloltte.  Ciick the "My Responses

onses” tab to provide your response, which may include Atachments, Forms, and ltems and

Lots

Response due date: Saturday, 09 October 2021 05:00 PM EDT

Want to participate later? Need more info?
Click | inmtend to Participate buton to le2 the buyer know

| intend to Participate View Evenl 2

All questions should be asked using the event message board (bottom left of the event). Having technical issues? Contact

sourcing supportficoupa.com

Click View Event and you will be taken to the evern page.

{acoupa

/|

£zcoupa

Note: If there are any changes to the Sourcing Event, you will receive an email indicating
that the Sourcing Event has been updated (example: “RFP: DS&J — DOJ Justice has been
changed - Sourcing Event #272"”). The email will list the updates. Click View Event to update

your response.
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Instructions

The Event Info page establishes whether you will participate in the Sourcing Event and provides
general information related to the Sourcing Event. The clock located at the top right indicates
when the event will end. You should pay special attention to the time remaining for a Sourcing
Event to ensure your response is submitted before the event time expires.

Sourcing Event Information Details
Do you intend to participate in this event? Select the check box to indicate participation.

Accept Terms and Conditions. You will not have to accept any Terms and Conditions to
view the event, send messages and/or enter a response.

E'

Event Information & Bidding Rules. This section provides basic information about the
Sourcing Event end time and Buyer (Procurement Professional) action.

E

Buyer Attachments. The Buyer Attachments section will not include content at this time.

HH

Timeline. Each Sourcing Event will provide a Timeline at the bottom of the Event Info page
which indicates the event start and the event end date and time. Once a Sourcing Event has
ended, you will no longer be able to view, edit or submit anything within Coupa related to
the Sourcing Event. Should the Sourcing Event be reopened to request additional
information, a Follow-On Sourcing Event will be issued under a different Sourcing Event
Number.

RFP : DS&) - DO)J Justice - Event #272 Acie \

Deloitte GPS Coupahas invited you to the sourcing event: RFP : DS&]) — DOJ Justice. If you intend to participate, review the event timeline and accept the terms
and conditions of the event, if applicable. Click the "My Responses” tab to provide your response, which may include Attachments, Forms, and Items and Lots.

m

Do you intend to participate in this event?

O lintend to participate in this event

Accept Terms and Conditions

There are no Terms and Conditions for the current event.

Event Information & Bidding Rules Buyer Attachments

Ty None

Event will end at the Event End Time.

Your responses are viewable by buyer once submitted E'v'a nc FO O.l,,;_o nin :C rmation

Buyer may choose to award individual line items

Timeline
- »

Ol EventStat
I 03:50 PM ameccation o 9 | 05:00PM

This eventis a Event #2028
follow-on of

8d : 1h : 9min

Enter Response

Z,:coupa

Business Spend Management - Accessibility

—_—m
Deloitte.

RFP : DS&] - DO) Justice - Event #272 =.ert ras zroes

Sourcing event #272 has already ended
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Submitting a Question or Requesting Additional Information

If after reviewing the event details and attachments, you have questions for the Deloitte GPS
Procurement Professional, submit your questions via the “Messages” functionality.

Be sure to include as much pertinent information as possible in your message. You can return to

the My Response page and click the “Messages” bar to view responses from the Deloitte GPS
Procurement Professional.

Messages 0~ | Messages 0

Hello [name of Deloitte GPS Procurement Professional],| have
a question aboutthe performance location. Will performance
be required at client location or vendor secured facility?

o

Having Technical Issues? Contact sourcing support@coupa com

The Procurement Professional’s response appears below. You will also receive the response via
email.

Messages (5

F
Helio [name of Delcite GFS Proourerment Professional]. | have a guesion aboul
the performance locaton. Wil performance be required at clent locaton or wendor
EOCwr T
read more
— The performance locabon it the chort e
-
Type new messaps
Vs
Harvrg Techrscal s ? Cortact sourong supoorifionupa corr
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Participating in Sourcing Events
If you intend to participate in the Sourcing Event, indicate your intent:

Check the box next to “l intend to participate in this event.” This does not bind you to
provide a response to the event but will alert the Deloitte Procurement Professional of your
intention to participate.

Click the Enter Response button at the bottom right of the screen to begin reviewing
specific event details and respond to the event.

Note: If another individual in your organization should submit the response, you can
forward the email to that individual. Please note that if you forward the response to
more than one person, there is a potential to have responses overwritten.

Do you intend to participate in this event?
I intend to participate in this event Ap—

. Accept Terms and Conditions

There are no Terms and Conditions for the current event

m

Event Information & Bidding Rules uyer Attachments

Ty None
Event will end at the Event End Time

Your responses are viewable by buyer once submitted

Buyer may choose to award individual line items

Timeline
-
Oct  Event Stat [ Oct |
u 03:50 PM amencarties_York 9 | 05:00 PM
B8d : Th : 9min 00:00

If you do not intend to participate:
Click the “Messages” bar at the bottom left of the screen.

Enter “NO BID” and click Send Message.
A message confirmation will appear at the top of the screen. The Message box will remain open
until it is minimized. Additional communication can be submitted if the Sourcing Event is active.

essoges °
—

NO BID|

Note: This Message will be received by the Deloitte Procurement Professional and
will let them know that you will not be submitting a bid in response to this event.
This will serve as your company’s notification to Deloitte of “No Bid” for this Sourcing
Event. If you decide to participate later, as long as the Sourcing Event is active, access
the email and take the actions listed above.



GPS Coupa

Sourcing Events for Vendors
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Responding to a Sourcing Event

After clicking on Enter Response on the Event Info page, the screen will display the “My
Response” tab where you provide attachments and information related to each section.

Open and review each attachment on the My Response tab. The cover letter/event

instructions will be the first attachment and will include important information necessary

for responding to the event. The Deloitte Procurement Professional may include other

attachments either for your information or which require your response.

~

Deloitte Procurement Team mada the foliowing changes to this event

Attachments v

Provided by Deloitte Procurement Team Your response
RFP Cover Letter/Event Instruction Response to RFP Cover Letter/Event Instructions
Instructions Attachment

Please read this GOCL‘“Q"'.CS’Q‘.‘\{ for S0urcing event INSructons and Add File

evaluation critena.

Attachment /

Statement of Work Response to Statement of Worl

Instructions Attachment

Review the attached Statement of Work. Add File

Attachment /

vendor Cover Letter Response to Vendor Cover Letter

Instructions Attachment

Flease provide a cover letter Add File

Attachment

Important Note: For attachment sections that require a response, an attachment
must be uploaded in order to submit a response to the Sourcing Event. You can

Save the event if you would like to complete the response at a later date or
save/continue your response. The Save button is located at the bottom of the screen.

Export to Excel Import from Excel

Load History Submit Response to Buyer ‘
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Attach one or more response documents as follows:

. Within each Attachment section, click “File” and locate the file to be uploaded to
the Sourcing Event response.

. You can also “drag and drop” documents from your desktop into the “Drop files
here” area by clicking on File, click Browse and locate the file. Drag the file to
the “Drop files here” area and release.

Attachment

em—————— X
¢
n—— « L » This PC > Desktop » Project Folder
Organize ~ New folder
u” Name

Statement of Work Respons
U Statement of Work Response.d

= W=
- = L "

: =+ Copy File name: | Statement of Work Response.docx

>

n Forms — This section will not be utilized at this time.

Submitting Pricing (Items and Lots)

a. Pricing information is submitted via the “Items and Lots” section. Deloitte GPS
will not accept price proposals uploaded as an attachment to the Coupa Sourcing
Event or sent outside of the Coupa system. Deloitte GPS will only evaluate and
award the price or quote which has been submitted via the “Items and Lots”
section in Coupa.

1. The cover letter will detail the type of pricing requested, which
could be a rate card, rates and hours, or a firm fixed price.



Coupa

Sourcing Events for Vendors
Instructions

2. Depending on the type of pricing requested, you may have to complete an
estimated quantity (hours) and the hourly rate (My Price). The system will
calculate the total.

a) For goods, you are required to enter the name of the Original
Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) in the Description field. If the item
is for a software licensing, the End User License Agreement (EULA)
attachment is required.

b) For rate cards, you will only complete My Price which the
proposed hourly rate.

c) Forfirm fixed price, you will provide the expected quantity of the
identified deliverable and the total firm fixed price for the
deliverable (My Price).

d) You are required to enter a response to each item listed in the
Items and Lots section.

e) If you do notintend to bid on a particular labor category or part,
enter 0.00 for My Price.

Important Note: The Flag ( )indicates an update was made to the pricing entry.

b. There are three methods to enter pricing information:
1. Method 1

a) Enter the proposed hourly rate for each item directly in the table.
The total will automatically calculate.

8  items Notin Lots (3 items)

™ Sr Manager NT) = J 0.00

W Manager q . 0.00

=  Consultant y * P 0.00

2. Method 2

a) Hover over the item. A pencil icon will appear indicating that
additional information is required for that item (e.g., goods item
description).

b) Click the Cart next to the item name.
c) Enter the rate and description if required.

d)  Click Save.

10
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Responding to a Sourcing Event (cont’d)

e) The total will automatically calculate.

1325000 US

S Deskiops 500 (EACH o
o M Desktop: 550.00
ey oo
S Office Desk 2500 EACH) = 26000 625000 LSO
Oeserpton
|>m,u.mm—m. | o 1P Lapiops 5000 (BACH 726500 " 325000 USO
I Total §6,260.00 USD

= > P

3. Method 3

a) Export the table, complete the file, and import the completed file to the
Sourcing Event:

— Click the “Export to Excel” button at the bottom of the “Items
and Lots” section.

= Items and Lots v
Name My Capacity Expected Qty My Price Price x Expected Qty >
¥  ltems Notin Lots {4 items) 0.0000 usD
= Laptop 0.00 (EACH) * . 0.00 USC
o Keyboards 10.00 (EACH) x 000 US
W Printers 200 (EACH) * E 0.00 US
0 (EACH) x - 0.00 US

w{  Equipment Manager

Total 0.00 USD

[ I have reviewed the changes to this event

Export to Excel Import from Excel Load History Save

The message below appears at the top of the screen.

— Open the Excel file.

11
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Sourcing Events for Vendors
Instructions

Important Note: a) DO NOT RENAME THIS DOCUMENT, (b) DO NOT CHANGE THE FILE
TYPE, (c) DO NOT CHANGE INFORMATION IN THE FILE and (c) DO NOT CHANGE THE

FILE DOWNLOAD LOCATION. Coupa will only accept your response if the document
maintains the same name and file type that the Coupa system provided during download.

— Complete the Excel table
Important Note: DO NOT EDIT FIELD NAMES or PRE-FILLED DATA..

;‘gcou The White Cells below are your enlry fields. You can upload ihis file fo save the informaion you entered in the editable cells to your response.
NS NOTE: This Excel file is locked to ensure it uploads correctly. and you must still dlick “submit* after uploading to submit!

upa - S (test)

Quantity UOM Information § Hints Field Type Need by date
Aothing R MA NA hB4

| Your ltem Mame: N
Your IDPart Number: _V;I
e s
v e
e . p——
Your Capacity: N 1
Currency: ¥ |USD
Your Item Mame: N
Your IDPart Murnber: N
e N
. Your Unit Price for "[item name]” — Enter pricing in Column C. This number entered

will appear in the Items and Lots “My Price” column.
. Your Capacity — Do not change.
. Currency — Do not change.
o Your Item Name — Leave blank.
. Your ID/Part Number — Leave blank.

. Your Description — For goods, the name of the Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM)
is required.

° Your Lead Time — Leave blank.

— Save and Close the file.

Reminder: DO NOT RENAME and DO NOT CHANGE THE SAVE LOCATION.
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Responding to a Sourcing Event (cont’d)

b) Import the Excel table by clicking the “Import from Excel” button at the bottom of
the “Items and Lots” section.

| Export to Excel ‘ Import from Excel Load History Save

— After clicking on the “Import from Excel” button, the following pop-up
box will appear.

— SKIP STEPS 1 and 2
— Click Choose File in Step 3 and locate the file.

Hint: The file may be in the default folder where your downloaded files are
stored.

RFP : DS&J - DOJ Justice - Excel Upload
Steps for uploading your response in Excel

1. Download the Response Template (Note: This template will only work for this event)
2. Fill in or update the Excel file.
* Fields marked with a "= are mandatory. Do not unlock/unprotect the Excel fle if you plan to upload it.
* Values in the uploaded file will replace anything currently saved 10 your response.
* Once you click "Start Upload" vaiues in the exoel file will be saved, but not submitted
= Once upload is compiete, review your response and click "Submit " Your response will not be sent uns! you do so
3. Load the updated file
—_— original filename xisx
Uploading will only save your response. You must click "Submit” to send it to the buyer.
This is referring to the initial export.

—
Ignore this notation. D —— Export completed successfully X

— Click Start Upload which will begin uploading the file. The following

message appears at the top of the screen to confirm the file was
successfully imported.

Excel import successful. Remember to submit your changes below.

Items and Lots is completed.

“Items Not In Lots” notation does

not apply. Ignore this message, B Mems Notin Lots (4 items) 11,050.0000 USD
= Laptop 72500 " 7.25000 US
W Keyboards 75.00 ° 730.00 US
[ Printers 425.00 " 850.00 US
W Equipment Manager 2.,200.00 * 2.200.00

Tolal 11,050.00 USD

13
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Responding to a Sourcing Event (cont’d)
ﬂ Once you have attached all required files, completed all required fields and any additional
fields to support the Sourcing Event response,

a. Select Event Info tab at the top of the page and confirm that you have select |
intend to participate in this event.

b. Select My Response tab and scroll to the bottom of the page. Click the Submit
Response to Buyer button.

Export to Excel Import from Excel Load History Save _I ‘ A—

The below message appears after submission is completed. The Deloitte GPS
Procurement Professional will receive the submission.

g o o

14
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Submitting Multiple Responses

If the Sourcing Event accepts more than one response, the Name field will appear at the top of the
event. Multiple responses allow for alternative responses to be submitted. After clicking on Enter
Response on the Event Info page, the screen will display the “My Response” tab where you
provide attachments and information related to each section.

Enter your name or email address in the Name field.

RFP : SLHE - VIRGINIA - Event #280 acve

Attachments v

Complete the response, save for later completion and/or submit the response as usual.

When View Event is selected, the most recent response is opened. To create a new response,
click on Event Info or My Responses, and click on Enter Response at the bottom right.

To edit one of the responses (event must be active), click on My Response and select the
pencil next to the desired response.

Response Name State Submitted At Total Actions /
|Cor':a:t Manager 1 working 7.000.00 E _/

Contract Manager 2 submitted 10/15/21 8.000.00 E ’/

Contract Manager 3 working 6,200.00 =/

Perpage 15 45 | €0

15
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Editing a Response
A Sourcing Event can be edited as long as the event is active.

To edit a Sourcing Event that has not been submitted, open the email and select View
Event. When the event is displayed, select My Response.

For Sourcing Events that allow multiple responses, select My Response and select the pencil
next to the desired response.

After editing the response, click the Submit Response to Buyer button.

Responding to a “Follow-On” Event

A Follow-On Sourcing Event occurs when an event is ended but additional information is needed
or requirements have been revised. Your original Sourcing Event number will be renamed to
contain a letter after the event number (example Sourcing Event 438 will be renamed 438a). You
will receive an email for the Follow-On Sourcing Event with a link to your original response for
reference only. You will not be able to edit the original response.

RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice invitation - Sourcing Event #272

Deloitte GPS Coupa <do_not_reply@deloitte-gps.coupahost.com>

Deloitte. RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice invitation - Sourcing Event#272

(acoupa

Deloitte GPS Coupa has invited you to the sourcing event RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice.

Want to participate later? Need more info?
Click | intend to Participate bution to let the buyer know Click View Event and you will be taken to the evert page.

I intend to Participate

,2coupa

Select View Event. Your response to the original Sourcing Event will appear. Review and update
the response as desired and click the Submit Response to Buyer button.

16
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Deleting a Response
You will not be able to delete a response you submitted.

If you determine to not participate after submitting a bid, click the Message bar at the bottom left
of the screen, type “NO BID” and click Send Message.

Viewing Sourcing Event Changes and Updating Responses

If the Procurement Professional makes any changes to the Sourcing Event, you will receive an
email indicating that the Sourcing Event has been updated (example: “RFP: DS&J — DOJ Justice has
been changed - Sourcing Event #272”). The email will list the information that has changed. In
addition, the Sourcing Event will include a list of the changes.

Deloitte. RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice has been changed - Sourcing Event #272

£»coupa

Deloitte GPS Coupa has made the following changes to the sourting event RFP : DS&J — DOJ Justice.

Items and lots

Added It

Event information

Updated "Description” from "RFP : SLHE - ARKANSAS™ 1o "RFP | DS&J ~ DOJ Justice'

Attachments

hment name: RFP Cover Letter/Event Instructions
chment file: RFP_Cover_Letter_-_Event_ 272 docx
ent name: Statement of Wo
ent file: RFP_Statement_of L
nt name: Vendor Cover Letter

Added File attachment file: Viendor_Cowver_L Event__272 docx

Message Center at

e in any manner to enter into an

for any information efforts expended by

Need more info?
Click View Event and you wil be taken 12 the event page

Click View Event to open the Sourcing Event and review all changes. AFlag ( ) is placed next to
any Sourcing Event details that were changed. Before submitting response, you will be prompted
to confirm that you have reviewed the changes.

O | have reviewed the changes to this event
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Viewing a List of Deloitte GPS Sourcing Events

Click the house icon at the top left of the screen to access your Sourcing Response Portal. This
page contains a listing of all Deloitte GPS sourcing events for which you have been invited to
participate. From here you can select a Sourcing Event, edit the existing response (if the Sourcing
Event is active) or create new responses (if permitted by the Sourcing Event).

Deloitte.

_

Welcome to your Sourcing Response Portal!

All Sourcing Events
== cm—
Event # Event Name Start Date End Date Status Type Responses

I 235 RFP : DS&J - DEF AIR FORCE 10111721 1031721 Prod RFP 0
282 RFP : DS&J - DOJ Justice 10111721 10220021 Prod RFP 0
280 RFP : SLHE - VIRGINIA 10111721 103021 Prod RFP 0
272 RFP : DS&J - DOJ Justice 1001721 10006721 Complete RFP 0

Perpage 15 | 45 | 90

Reviewing the History of Sourcing Event Activity

Click Load History at the bottom of the screen to view a history of activity for the event. Select
Export History to download History details.

ot | | npmitomcs (T

Y History e

ncredible JOUINEY on 10115721 2t 03:12 AM EDT
Response : Incredible Journey - #352, Total amount: 485.00 USD more details
Suppler Incredible Journey saved their response
Suppher Incredible Journey changed Price Amount on line item #3 Consultant from None to 75.0
Supplier Incredible Journey changed Price Amount on line item #2 Manager from None to 110.0
ncredible Journey on 10/15/21 at 03:11 AM EDT
Supplier Incredible Journey changed Price Amount on line item #1 Snr.Manager from None o 150.0
Suppher Incredible Journey intends to respond to sourcing event
ncredible Journey on 10114721 at 11:17 AMEDT
Supgher Incredible Journey don't intends to respend to sourcing event
ncredible Journey on 10711721 at 08:13 PM EDT
Supplier clicked Enter Response button
W Smith on 1011721 at 539 PM EDT
Buyer launched event
Buyer changed 'Event Start’ from 2021-10-11 17:37:07 -0400 to 2021-10-11 17:39:35 -0400

Export History e

18
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The purpose of this section is to address anticipated frequently asked questions. If you encounter
a situation and are unsure how to proceed, contact your Deloitte GPS Procurement Professional
for assistance.

For questions technical in nature, access the Vendor Portal at
https://vendorportal.gps.deloitte.com and click the Contact Us button (§)]) at the top of the
webpage. Select the topic Deloitte GPS Coupa Question, complete the rest of the form, and click
Submit.

1. Dol need to register or create an account with Coupa to respond to a Sourcing Event?

*  You do not have to register or create an account with Coupa to respond to a Sourcing
Event.

2. There are instructions to register in the GPS Vendor Portal. How is this different than Coupa?

*  The Government & Public Services (GPS) Vendor Portal is a site used by the Deloitte
government practice to collect information and compliance documentation from our
vendors. It is not linked or connected to Coupa. Coupa is a separate system and is
used to obtain vendor response (quotes) to sourcing events.

3. Can |l submit my proposal or quote via email?

* All proposals and quotes requested through Coupa must be submitted via Coupa.
Deloitte GPS is not able to accept proposals or quotes submitted outside of the Coupa
system.

4. How do | submit a question regarding the Sourcing Event?

* To submit a question, click View Event and click the Messages bar located at the
bottom left of the screen.

5. Dol have to provide a rate for all tems and Lots?

* Aresponse is required for all ltems and Lots. If you do not want to submit a price,
enter 0.00 in the “My Price” field.

6. How do | propose an alternative part?

* To propose an alternative part, include information about the alternative part(s) in
your proposal cover letter to include manufacturer, part #, and price. If the alternative
part is acceptable, a “Follow-On Sourcing Event” will be issued which updates the
Items and Lots section to include the proposed alternative part. Complete the Follow-
On Sourcing Event with the price for the alternative part in Items and Lots.


https://vendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/
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For questions technical in nature, access the Vendor Portal at
https://vendorportal.gps.deloitte.com and click the Contact Us button ([]) at the top of the

webpage. Select the topic Deloitte GPS Coupa Question, complete the rest of the form, and click
Submit.

7.

10.

11.

12.

How do | provide an escalation for option periods and not calculate the price?

* Inthe Item and Lots section, use the escalation you propose to calculate the price for
the option periods. Also, in your proposal cover letter include a statement of the
proposed escalation percentage and note prices quoted are using the base period
price plus the escalation proposed and are estimated.

Can | propose in another currency?

*  Proposals are only accepted in USD. You can attach a quote in another currency for
reference; but to be considered for award, quotes are required in USD under the
Items and Lots section of the system.

| did not update a price on a revised item and the event ended.

*  Once the event has ended, you cannot submit revisions. Contact your Procurement
Professional to determine if there is an opportunity to update the price.

| added an item but did not use the naming convention. How do | update the item to have the
correct naming convention?

* If you did not use the correct naming convention, you will be ineligible for an award.
Contact your Procurement Professional to determine if there is an opportunity to
make a correction.

| attached the quote instead of responding with prices in the Items and Lots?

*  All pricing must be submitted via the Items and Lots section. Contact your
Procurement Professional to determine if there is an opportunity to submit Items and
Lots.

What is a Follow-On Sourcing Event?

* A Follow-On Sourcing Event occurs when an event is ended but additional information
is needed or requirements have been revised. Your original Sourcing Event number
will be renamed to contain a letter after the event number (example Sourcing Event
438 will be renamed 438a). You will receive an email for the Follow-On Sourcing Event
with a link to your original response for reference only. You will not be able to edit the
original response.

*  When you click on View Event for the Follow-On Sourcing Event, your response to the
original Sourcing Event will appear. Edit the response as needed and submit.

20
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Resources
Quick Reference Guides and Support Information

Below are reference material to assist you in navigating various transactions with Deloitte GPS and
obtaining support.

Quick Reference Guides

e Vendor Setup for Coupa Supplier Portal (CSP)

e Sourcing Instructions for Vendors

e Contract Authoring

* Purchase Orders

e (CSP Invoicing

NOTE: The Quick Reference Guides are also available in two locations:

*  GPS Vendor Connect Coupa Supplier Portal page; select Coupa Supplier Portal

* Your GPS Vendor Portal dashboard under the Coupa User Guides Links tile

Support Contacts

Topic Who to Contact
Coupa Supplier Portal Registration e Access Coupa Chat in the lower right of the screen
e Utilize Help feature in the upper right of the screen

e Contact Coupa Support at supplier@coupa.com

MFA Questions — Coupa only e Contact Coupa Support at supplier@coupa.com

Invoice and Payment Status e Contact Deloitte GPS Accounts Payable at
invoices@deloitte-gps.coupahost.com

Purchase Orders Status e Contact your Deloitte Procurement Representative

e Contact GPS Vendor Portal System Management team
at usgpsvendorportalsystemmgt@deloitte.com

Contracting and DocuSign e Contact your Deloitte Procurement Representative
Other Coupa questions related to e Contact your Deloitte Procurement Representative
transactions with Deloitte e Contact GPS Vendor Portal System Management team

at usgpsvendorportalsystemmgt@deloitte.com

Other questions related to Coupa e Access Coupa Chat in the lower right of the screen
functionality e Utilize Help feature in the upper right of the screen

e Contact Coupa Support at supplier@coupa.com
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https://svendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/api/Attachment/GetByName?attachmentName=Vendor_Setup_for_Coupa_Supplier_Portal_(CSP).pdf
https://svendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/api/Attachment/GetByName?attachmentName=Sourcing_Instructions_for_Vendors.pdf
https://svendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/api/Attachment/GetByName?attachmentName=Contract_Authoring.pdf
https://svendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/api/Attachment/GetByName?attachmentName=Purchase_Orders.pdf
https://svendorportal.gps.deloitte.com/api/Attachment/GetByName?attachmentName=CSP_Invoicing.pdf
https://vendorconnect.gps.deloitte.com/#/
mailto:supplier@coupa.com
mailto:supplier@coupa.com
mailto:invoices@deloitte-gps.coupahost.com
mailto:usgpsvendorportalsystemmgt@deloitte.com
mailto:usgpsvendorportalsystemmgt@deloitte.com
mailto:supplier@coupa.com
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